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1 4028 Signal Stat/Grote UNIVERSAL stt LAMP GROTE 52602 10
4028 JOBBER 24.00% NAPA LIT TRUCK LITE 08-26-19 29.25$          (22.23)$       (222.30)$             52602 JOBBER 11.00% GROTE 24.43$           (21.74)$               (217.43)$             ST60RBP LIST 41.00%

OPTRONICS OPT ST60RBP LIST 

PRICE 08/28/19 30.49$                (17.99)$                     (179.89)$                    

2 EB7930A ECCO
STROBE LAMP CLASS II 821-5593 OR EQUIV. 

FLANGE/PIPE MOUNT
20

821-5593 JOBBER 24.00% NAPA BK BALKAMP 08-26-19 117.27$        (89.13)$       (1,782.50)$           255HTSLA JOBBER 18.00% STAR WARNING SYSTEMS 125.84$         (103.19)$             (2,063.78)$          EB7930A LIST 41.00%
SPECIAL ORDER - NO BID 

-$                    -$                         -$                           

3 1255H11N PHILLIPS
HALOGEN HEADLAMP 1255H11 1325 LUMENS 

MIN OUTPUT
100

1255H11N JOBBER 37.00%
NAPA LMP 08-26-19

11.09$          (6.99)$         (698.67)$             H11C1 JOBBER 29.00%
PHILLIPS

6.95$            (4.93)$                 (493.45)$             H11BP LIST 41.00%
SYLVANIA SYL H11BP

28.80$                (16.99)$                     (1,699.20)$                 

4
SAME APPLICATION AS 

ABOVE
VALUE LINE PRODUCT

HALOGEN HEADLAMP 1255H11 1325 LUMENS 

MIN OUTPUT
20

1255H11N JOBBER 11.00% NAPA AVA ADVANTAGE 08-26-19 9.05$            (8.05)$         (161.09)$             H11-55WLL JOBBER 29.00% PHILLIPS 10.98$           (7.80)$                 (155.92)$             H1155LL-BP LIST 41.00%

EIKO EIK H1155LL-BP LIST PRICE 

08/28/19 16.93$                (9.99)$                      (199.77)$                    

5 821-4784 OR GM2502261 BALKAMP LKQ
COMPLETE HEADLAMP ASSEMBLY 13 IMPALA 

LEFT SIDE 
10

821-4784 JOBBER 24.00% NAPA BK BALKAMP 08-26-19 127.49$        (96.89)$       (968.92)$             20-6746-00-1 JOBBER 17.00% TYC 81.23$           (67.42)$               (674.21)$             20-6746-00-1 LIST 41.00%

TYC 20-6746-00-1 LIST PRICE 

08/28/19 242.36$              (142.99)$                   (1,429.92)$                 

6 8160 TRUCK-LITE 4" LED work light 750 lumens min. 10 8160 JOBBER 24.00% NAPA LIT TRUCK LITE 08-26-19 95.41$          (72.51)$       (725.12)$             8160 JOBBER 17.00% TRUCKLITE 134.11$         89.85$                898.50$              54209-025 LIST 41.00% SPECIAL ORDER -$                    -$                         -$                           

7 325K,325V UNITY
 6” ROUND POST MOUNTED POLICE 

SPOTLIGHT    (CHROME HEAD)          730-1373
10

730-1373 JOBBER 24.00% NAPA BK BALKAMP 08-26-19 145.80$        (110.81)$     (1,108.08)$           325V LIST 32.00% UNITY 266.66$         (181.33)$             (1,813.29)$          201054 LIST 41.00%

SPECIAL ORDER - NO BID 

-$                    -$                         -$                           

DRIVETRAIN RELATED 

8 MS92467M FEL PRO EXH MAN GAS SET 13 GM TRUCKS 5.3L 10
MS97405 JOBBER 24.00% NAPA FPG FEL-PRO 08/26-19 17.90$          (13.60)$       (136.04)$             MS16124 JOBBER 22.00% MAHLE 14.68$           (11.45)$               (114.50)$             MS92467 LIST 41.00%

FELPRO FEL MS92467 LIST PRICE 

LIST 08/28/19 37.27$                (21.99)$                     (219.89)$                    

9 HS26190PT2 FEL PRO HEAD GAS SET 13    TAHOE 5.3L 5
HS26190PT2 JOBBER 24.00% NAPA FPG FEL-PRO 08/26-20 218.32$        (165.92)$     (829.62)$             HS54442D JOBBER 22.00% MAHLE 266.55$         (207.91)$             (1,039.55)$          HS26190PT2 LIST 41.00%

FELPRO FEL HS26190PT2 LIST 

PRICE 08/28/19 416.93$              (245.99)$                   (1,229.94)$                 

10
6003693, 904-262 OR 

4C3Z9P456AJ
FORD

EGR COOLER 6.0l FORD DIESEL TUBULAR 

DESIGN WITH GASKET KIT
5

6003693 JOBBER 28.00% NAPA NOE DORMAN 08-26-19 275.40$        (198.29)$     (991.44)$             904-262 JOBBER 26.00% DORMAN 249.53$         (184.65)$             (923.26)$             ECK1 LIST 41.00%

STANDARD IGNITION STD ECK1 

LIST PRICE 08/28/19 554.22$              (326.99)$                   (1,634.95)$                 

11 G11753 MOVERAS

REMAN 6L80 TRANSMISSION 3YR/50K 

WARRANTY 4CBA,5CBA 15 TAHOE HD WITH 

TRAILER TOW PKG. PRICE WITH XCH.

3
G11753 JOBBER 18.00% NAPA MTC MOVERAS 08-26-19 2,425.40$     (1,988.83)$  (5,966.48)$           6L80-4CBA LIST 20.00% AMERICAN TRANSMISSIONS 3,500.00$      (2,800.00)$          (8,400.00)$          

NO PART#

LIST 41.00%

SPECIAL ORDER - NO BID 

-$                    -$                         -$                           

13  2987 OR 602-2089 ANCHOR
MOTOR MOUNT OE Equivalent Design 2011 

IMPALA
5 2987 OR 602-

2089 JOBBER 24.00% NAPA BK BALKAMP 08-26-19 55.89$          (42.48)$       (212.38)$             EM2987 JOBBER 40.00% WESTAR 31.92$           (19.15)$               (95.76)$               B2987 LIST 41.00%

POWER TORQUE PTQ B2987 LIST 

PRICE 08/28/19 103.37$              (60.99)$                     (304.94)$                    

14 6002866 OR 674522 OR 12616285  DORMAN LEFT EXH MANIFOLD 05 TAHOE 5.3L 5
600-2866 JOBBER 28.00% NAPA NOE DORMAN 08-26-19 94.39$          (67.96)$       (339.80)$             674-522 JOBBER 26.00% DORMAN 93.18$           (68.95)$               (344.77)$             674-522 LIST 41.00%

DORMAN DOR 674-522 LIST PRICE 

08/28/19 147.77$              (87.18)$                     (435.92)$                    

15 234109, HM10027 OR 12625817 GM/DELPHI ECHLIN
NEW GDI FUEL PUMP OEM EQUIVALENT FOR 

15-18 GM TAHOE/TRUCKS
5

234109 JOBBER 14.00% NAPA CRB ECHLIN 08-26-19 284.92$        (245.03)$     (1,225.16)$           HPM1035 LIST 46.00% AC-DELCO 392.13$         (211.75)$             (1,058.75)$          HP22035 LIST 41.00%

PRECISION PFP HP22035 LIST 

PRICE 08/28/19 513.54$              (302.99)$                   (1,514.94)$                 

16 15510 BOSCH
OXYGEN SENSOR VARIOUS DODGE TRUCKS 14 

RAM 5.7L FRONT OF CONVERTER
10

15510 JOBBER 11.00% NAPA BSH BOSCH 08-26-19 34.51$          (30.71)$       (307.14)$             15510 JOBBER 34.00% BOSCH 51.17$           (33.77)$               (337.72)$             15510 LIST 41.00%

BOSCH BOS 15510 LIST PRICE 

08/28/19 54.22$                (31.99)$                     (319.90)$                    

17 260067 OR 19259452 NAPA/GM
THROTTLE POS SENSOR 15 TAHOE 5.3L OEM 

TYPE
10

260067 JOBBER 14.00% NAPA CRB ECHLIN 08-26-19 57.09$          (49.10)$       (490.97)$             TH445 JOBBER 11.00% STANDARD 34.86$           (31.03)$               (310.25)$             TH445 LIST 41.00%

STANDARD IGNITION STD TH445 

LIST PRICE 08/28/19 86.42$                (50.99)$                     (509.88)$                    

18 2252567 NAPA CANNISTER VENT VALVE 05 TAHOE 2142149 5
776-54301 JOBBER 28.00% NAPA NOE DORMAN 08-26-19 24.81$          (17.86)$       (89.32)$               214-2149 LIST 46.00% AC-DELCO 33.61$           (18.15)$               (90.75)$               CVS6 LIST 41.00%

STANDARD IGNITION STD CVS6 

LIST PRICE 08/28/19 52.53$                (30.99)$                     (154.96)$                    

19 9423 GATES/NAPA LOW RAD HOSE 03-09 C/VIC 4.6L W/OIL/COOL 5
9423 JOBBER 28.00% NAPA NBH GATES 08-26-19 21.94$          (15.80)$       (78.98)$               62930 JOBBER 24.00% CONTINENTAL ELITE 15.13$           (11.50)$               (57.49)$               22788 LIST 41.00%

GATES GAT 22788 LIST PRICE 

08/28/19 62.69$                (36.99)$                     (184.94)$                    

20 25060935 OR K060935 GATES/NAPA BELT SERP 13 TAHOE 5.3L 20
25-060935 JOBBER 19.00% NAPA NBH GATES 08-26-19 24.77$          (20.06)$       (401.27)$             4060935 JOBBER 24.00% CONTINENTAL ELITE 25.65$           (19.49)$               (389.88)$             K060935 LIST 41.00%

GATES GAT K060935 LIST PRICE 

08/28/19 52.53$                (30.99)$                     (619.85)$                    

21 9610-2 GATES
 BANDED 1.125 WIDTH HD BELT 259610-2 

WESTERN STAR W/CAT
10

25-9610-2 JOBBER 19.00% NAPA NBH GATES 08-26-19 30.13$          (24.41)$       (244.05)$             2/17611TT JOBBER 24.00% CONTINENTAL ELITE 39.24$           (29.82)$               (298.22)$             2/9610PB LIST 41.00%

GATES GAT 2/2610PB LIST PRICE 

08/28/19 101.68$              (59.99)$                     (599.91)$                    

22 660-3415 NAPA HEATER CORE 03-10 CROWN VICTORIA 10
660-3415 JOBBER 5.00% NAPA NHC 08-26-19 32.29$          (30.68)$       (306.76)$             8231335 JOBBER 24.00% GLOBAL PARTS 37.24$           (28.30)$               (283.02)$             94740 LIST 41.00%

MURRAY MHT 94740 LIST PRICE 

08/28/19 61.00$                (35.99)$                     (359.90)$                    

23 1830606C94 OR 42318 IHC/NAPA
WATER PUMP VARIOUS IHC DT SERIES 

ENGINES
10

42318HD JOBBER 29.00% NAPA TRUE FLOW TFW 08-26-19 165.89$        (117.78)$     (1,177.82)$           US3713 JOBBER 5.00% US MOTOR WORKS 53.05$           (50.40)$               (503.98)$             CP3713 LIST 41.00%

MURRAY MTC CP3713 LIST PRICE 

08/28/19 144.05$              (84.99)$                     (849.90)$                    

24 269 NAPA THERMOSTAT VAR APPLICATIONS 20
269 JOBBER 12.00% NAPA THERMOSTAT THM 08-26-19 3.41$            (3.00)$         (60.02)$               300-195 JOBBER 12.00% MOTORAD 2.47$            (2.17)$                 (43.47)$               3359 LIST 41.00%

MURRAY MCS 3359 LIST PRICE 

08/28/19 10.15$                (5.99)$                      (119.77)$                    

25 CU13398 MODINE RADIATOR 15 TAHOE W/HD TOWING 10
CU13398 JOBBER 11.00% NAPA RADIATOR NR 08-26-19 229.97$        (204.67)$     (2,046.73)$           13398 JOBBER 18.00% OSC 167.45$         (137.31)$             (1,373.09)$          8013398 LIST 41.00%

MURRAY MHT 8013398 LIST PRICE 

08/28/19 374.56$              (220.99)$                   (2,209.90)$                 

26 855-2506 NAPA
DUAL COOLING FAN ASSY W/SHROUD 14 

IMPALA 3.6L
5

855-2506 JOBBER 28.00% NAPA NOE DORMAN 08-26-19 157.77$        (113.59)$     (567.97)$             622790 JOBBER 17.00% TYC 147.96$         (122.81)$             (614.03)$             76028 LIST 41.00%
SPECIAL ORDER - NO BID 

-$                    -$                         -$                           

27 655-2345 NAPA
NEW A/C BLOWER MOTOR 09 C/VIC OE STYLE 

CONNECTOR WITH WHEEL
5

655-2345 JOBBER 24.00% NAPA BK BALKAMP 08-26-19 42.66$          (32.42)$       (162.11)$             700014 JOBBER 17.00% TYC 34.07$           (28.28)$               (141.39)$             PM9298 LIST 41.00%

MURRAY MRY PM9298 LIST PRICE 

08/28/19 79.64$                (46.99)$                     (234.94)$                    

28 74283 MODINE NEW CONDENSER 15-16 TAHOE HD 5
74283 JOBBER 11.00% NAPA MODINE MO 08-26-19 108.15$        (96.25)$       (481.27)$             4283C JOBBER 24.00% GLOBAL PARTS 86.88$           (66.03)$               (330.14)$             7*4283 LIST 41.00%

MURRAY MRY 7-4283 LIST PRICE 

08/28/19 250.83$              (147.99)$                   (739.95)$                    

29 273618, 22798744 NAPA/DELCO
NEW 7SBH17 COMPRESSOR 2016 IMPALA 

LIMITED 3.6l
5

273618 JOBBER 19.00% NAPA TEM 08-26-19 230.43$        (186.65)$     (933.24)$             15-22325 JOBBER 46.00% AC-DELCO 445.92$         (240.80)$             (1,203.98)$          198352 LIST 41.00%

MURRAY MRY 198352 LIST PRICE 

08/28/19 554.22$              (326.99)$                   (1,634.95)$                 

30 TEM82710N NAPA

NEW COMPRESSOR SERVICE KIT 13 TAHOE W/ 

COMPRESSOR, ACCUMULATOR, EXP VALVE 

AND OIL 

@TEM272531,TEM218671,TEM207345,TEM21731

4,TEM801651@;w/ 10S20F A/C Compressor;Front & 

Rear A/C 

10

TEM-82710N JOBBER 28.00% NAPA ACK 08-26-19 359.75$        (259.02)$     (2,590.20)$           9314754B JOBBER 24.00% GLOBAL PARTS 352.22$         (267.69)$             (2,676.87)$          77363 LIST 41.00%

MURRAY MRY 77363 LIST PRICE 

08/28/19

449.14$              (264.99)$                   (2,649.93)$                 

31 201707 NAPA 13 TAHOE A/;C DISCHARGE HOSE ASSY 5.3L 5
201707 JOBBER 19.00% NAPA TEM 08-26-19 92.09$          (74.59)$       (372.96)$             4811935 JOBBER 24.00% GLOBAL PARTS 64.95$           (49.36)$               (246.81)$             55007 LIST 41.00%

MURRAY MRY 550077 LIST PRICE 

08/28/19 186.42$              (109.99)$                   (549.94)$                    

32 H42504250R WEATHERHEAD
H425 SER SAE 100R2 #4 HYD HOSE 20,000PSI 

MIN, 250FT ROLL, PRICE PER ROLL NOT FOOT! 
4

H42-50425OR JOBBER 28.00% NAPA WEATHERHEAD WH 08-26-19 970.00$        (698.40)$     (2,793.60)$           SR2SN-04X250 JOBBER 24.00% CONTINENTAL 817.50$         (621.30)$             (2,485.20)$          70605 LIST 41.00%

GATES GAT 70605 550 FT ROLL 

LIST PRICE 08/28/19 5,211.02$           (3,074.50)$                (12,298.01)$               

33 3W1Z13K359BAB FORD
MULTIFUNCTION SWITCH 06-08 C/VIC SW6489 

DL6531
20

DL6531 JOBBER 33.00% NAPA ECH ECHLIN 08-26-19 73.11$          (48.98)$       (979.67)$             SW6489 LIST 40.00% MOTORCRAFT 90.73$           (54.44)$               (1,088.76)$          CBS1188 LIST 41.00%

STANDARD IGNITION STD 

CBS1188 LIST PRICE 08/28/19 130.49$              (76.99)$                     (1,539.78)$                 

34 960Y100 TRUCK LITE
TURN SIGNAL SWITCH NAVISTAR APP 

3566945C91 
10

960Y100 JOBBER 24.00% NAPA LIT TRUCK LITE 08-26-19 90.37$          (68.68)$       (686.81)$             960Y100 JOBBER 33.00% TRUCKLITE 125.10$         (83.82)$               (838.17)$             48072 LIST 41.00%

GROTE GRO 48072 LIST PRICE 

08/28/19 137.27$              (80.99)$                     (809.89)$                    

35 4N6992, 12645298 RAYLOC/ REMY/GM
NEW STARTER VARIOUS GM & IMPALA THRU 

2018
10

4N6992 JOBBER 28.00% NAPA NNE 08-26-19 235.44$        (169.52)$     (1,695.17)$           12645298 LIST 46.00% AC-DELCO 284.10$         (153.41)$             (1,534.14)$          N612988A LIST 41.00%

ULTIMA SELECT USL N612988A 

LIST PRICE 08/28/19 394.90$              (232.99)$                   (2,329.91)$                 

36
213-8483, GLV8642RM 

6W7Z10V346AARM
VALUE LINE PRODUCT

REMAN 200A ALTERNATOR 08-11 C/VIC 

(EXCHANGE)
5

213-8483 JOBBER 29.00% NAPA RAYLOC RAY 08-26-19 252.66$        (179.39)$     (896.94)$             GLV8984RM LIST 40.00% MOTORCRAFT 247.69$         (148.61)$             (743.07)$             R110025A LIST 41.00%

ULTIMA ULT R110025A LIST PRICE 

08/28/19 322.02$              (189.99)$                   (949.96)$                    

37 1N4828, 25877026 NAPA/GM
PREMIUM NEW ALTERNATOR 160A 13 TAHOE 

5.3L
20

1N4828 JOBBER 28.00% NAPA NNE 08-26-19 187.68$        (135.13)$     (2,702.59)$           25877026 LIST 46.00% AC-DELCO 576.71$         (311.42)$             (6,228.47)$          N112016A LIST 41.00%

ULTIMA SELECT USL N112016A 

LIST PRICE 08/28/19 311.85$              (183.99)$                   (3,679.83)$                 

38 91-01-4354 WILSON 28MT STARTER CUMMINS APPLICATION 5
91-01-4354 JOBBER 19.00% NAPA WIL WILSON 08-26-19 167.15$        (135.39)$     (676.96)$             91-01-4354 JOBBER 15.00% WILSON 142.86$         (121.43)$             (607.16)$             91-01-4354 LIST 41.00%

WILSON WIL 91-01-4354 LIST 

PRICE 08-28/19 327.10$              (192.99)$                   (964.95)$                    

39
110-555 OR 8LHA2070VF OR  

90059304N
LEECENEVILLE/ WILSON NEW HD TRUCK ALTERNATOR 160A 5

90-059-304N JOBBER 19.00% NAPA WIL WILSON 08-26-19 308.89$        (250.20)$     (1,251.00)$           8600310 JOBBER 9.00% DELCO REMY 201.21$         (183.10)$             (915.51)$             90-05-9304N LIST 41.00%

WILSON WIL 90-05-9304N LIST 

PRICE 08/28/19 579.64$              (341.99)$                   (1,709.94)$                 

40 7807012,923-212, 25811698 GM/NAPA Third brake light 14 Tahoe 923-212 5
780-7012 JOBBER 28.00% NAPA NOE DORMAN 08-26-19 150.53$        (108.38)$     (541.91)$             923-212 JOBBER 26.00% DORMAN 141.35$         (104.60)$             (523.00)$             923-212 LIST 41.00%

DORMAN DOR 923-212 LIST PRICE 

08/28/19 257.61$              (151.99)$                   (759.95)$                    

41 92-1021C OR 13586335 NAPA/GM TPMS SENSOR 2010 UP VAR GM APPLICATIONS 20
92-1021C JOBBER 33.00% NAPA ECH ECHLIN 08-26-19 36.32$          (24.33)$       (486.69)$             13598771 LIST 46.00% AC-DELCO 85.37$           (46.10)$               (922.00)$             20153 LIST 41.00%

SCHRADER SCH 20153 LIST PRICE 

8/28/19 89.81$                (52.99)$                     (1,059.76)$                 

SENSORS/IGNITION/EXHAUST

3

O'REILLY AUTOMOTIVE STORES, INC. D/B/A O'REILLY AUTO PARTS

2
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ITB 123-19
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SWITCHES AND ROTATING ELECTRICAL
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O'REILLY AUTOMOTIVE STORES, INC. D/B/A O'REILLY AUTO PARTSTPH/THE PARTS HOUSE GENUINE PARTS CO/ NAPA

PART#

42 IC534,12573190, GN10165,D514A NAPA/GM/DELPHI IGN COIL VARIOUS GM ROUND DESIGN 50
IC534 JOBBER 33.00% NAPA ECH ECHLIN 08-26-19 54.40$          (36.45)$       (1,822.40)$           UF414 JOBBER 11.00% STANDARD 37.70$           (33.55)$               (1,677.65)$          2-50016 LIST 41.00%

MASTERPRO MPI 2-50016 LIST 

PRICE 08/28/19 81.34$                (47.99)$                     (2,399.53)$                 

43 IC369SB VALUE LINE PRODUCT IGN COIL 03-08 C/VIC POL  IC369SB VALUE 20
IC369SB JOBBER 5.00% NAPA MILEAGE PLU MPE 08-26-19 24.83$          (23.59)$       (471.77)$             FD503T JOBBER 11.00% STANDARD 13.30$           (11.84)$               (236.74)$             2-50006 LIST 41.00%

MASTERPRO MPI 2-50006 LIST 

PRICE 08/28/19 57.61$                (33.99)$                     (679.80)$                    

44 APP764 AUTOLITE SPARK PLUG DOUBLE PLATINUM 240
APP104 JOBBER 9.00% NAPA ASP AUTOLITE 4.62$            (4.20)$         (1,009.01)$           SP432 LIST 40.00% MOTORCRAFT 6.00$            (3.60)$                 (864.00)$             APP104 LIST 41.00%

AUTOLITE ATO APP104 LIST PRICE 

08/28/19 9.14$                  (5.39)$                      (1,294.22)$                 

45 702418 BELDEN
PREMIUM PLUG BOOTS (EACH) 03 UP 4.6L 

FORD
120

702418 JOBBER 22.00% NAPA BEL BELDEN 08-26-19 4.81$            (3.75)$         (450.22)$             SPP39E JOBBER 11.00% STANDARD 3.97$            (3.53)$                 (424.00)$             99-102 LIST 41.00%

ULTIMA SELECT USW 99-102 LIST 

PRICE 08/28/19 8.17$                  (4.82)$                      (578.44)$                    

47 35460 WALKER EXHAUST INSULATOR VAR. APPLICATIONS 10
35460 JOBBER 27.00% NAPA EXH WALKER 08-26-19 5.57$            (4.07)$         (40.66)$               35460 JOBBER 24.00% WALKER 5.46$            (4.15)$                 (41.50)$               35460 LIST 41.00%

NICKSON NIC 25460 LIST PRICE 

08/28/19 3.71$                  (2.19)$                      (21.89)$                      

48 50497 WALKER DIRECT FIT CAT CONVERTER 15 TAHOE 5.3L 5
50497 JOBBER 27.00% NAPA EXH WALKER 08-26-19 793.86$        (579.52)$     (2,897.59)$           50497 JOBBER 24.00% WALKER 786.13$         (597.46)$             (2,987.29)$          52642 LIST 41.00%

MAGNAFLOW MFG 52642 LIST 

PRICE 08/28/19 1,564.39$           (922.99)$                   (4,614.95)$                 

49 1-8853 ATP PREMIUM TRANS FILTER GM APPLICATION 50
1*8853 JOBBER 25.00% NAPA ATP 08-26-19 27.30$          (20.48)$       (1,023.75)$           B240 JOBBER 27.00% ATP 22.09$           (16.13)$               (806.29)$             58369 LIST 41.00%

MAGNAFLOW MFG 52642 LIST 

PRICE 08/28/19 79.64$                (46.99)$                     (2,349.38)$                 

50 221143 OR 19259876 CARDONE, GM DELCO

COMPLETE REMAN RACK/PINION 7B3 OPTION 

W INNER TIE ROD ENDS 14-16 IMPALA 

LIMITED (W/EXCH)

5
221143 JOBBER 20.00% NAPA NRP CARDONE 08-26-19 244.68$        (195.74)$     (978.72)$             103-0306 JOBBER 34.00% VISION OE 324.02$         (213.85)$             (1,069.27)$          103-0306 LIST 41.00%

MASTERPRO MPP 103-0306 LIST 

PRICE 08/28/19 510.15$              (300.99)$                   (1,504.94)$                 

51 6W1Z4234A 630-413 OR 8196793 FORD/NAPA Rear axle 09 Crown Victoria 819-6793 10
819-6793 JOBBER 28.00% NAPA NOE DORMAN 08-26-19 165.42$        (119.10)$     (1,191.02)$           630-413 JOBBER 26.00% DORMAN 155.32$         (114.94)$             (1,149.37)$          630-413 LIST 41.00%

DORMAN DOR 630-413 LIST PRICE 

08/28/19 245.75$              (144.99)$                   (1,449.93)$                 

52 8660S NATIONAL SEAL REAR AXLE 03-UP C/VIC 50
13992 JOBBER 28.00% NAPA OIL SEAL NOS 08-26-19 3.14$            (2.26)$         (113.04)$             8660S JOBBER 22.00% TIMKEN 2.93$            (2.29)$                 (114.27)$             8660S LIST 41.00%

NATIONAL NAT 8660S LIST PRICE 

08/28/19 13.54$                (7.99)$                      (399.43)$                    

53 592A BCA AXLE BEARING TRUCK APP. 5
592A JOBBER 18.00% NAPA TRACTION TWD 08-26-19 26.48$          (21.71)$       (108.57)$             592A JOBBER 22.00% TIMKEN 28.27$           (22.05)$               (110.25)$             592A LIST 41.00%

NATIONAL BCA 592A LIST PRICE 

08/28/19 79.64$                (46.99)$                     (234.94)$                    

54 R1563TAV BCA REAR AXLE BEARING VAR APP 50
R1563TAV JOBBER 20.00% NAPA BEARING BRG 08-26-19 21.32$          (17.06)$       (852.80)$             5707 JOBBER 22.00% TIMKEN 17.57$           (13.70)$               (685.23)$             5707 LIST 41.00%

NATIONAL BCA 5707 LIST PRICE 

08/28/19 35.58$                (20.99)$                     (1,049.61)$                 

55 BR930858 OR 5154171AA SKF/MOPAR
PREMIUM GRADE FRT HUB/BRG ASSY 14 

DODGE RAM 1500 4X4 W/ABS
5

BR-930858 JOBBER 20.00% NAPA BEARING BRG 08-26-19 91.45$          (73.16)$       (365.80)$             HA590515 JOBBER 22.00% TIMKEN 125.21$         (97.66)$               (488.32)$             515151 LIST 41.00%

NATIONAL BCA 5707 LIST PRICE 

08/28/19 371.17$              (218.99)$                   (1,094.95)$                 

56 2605587, K80538, 22947665 NAPA,MOOG,DELCO
COMPLETE NEW FRONT RIGHT LOWER 

CONTROL ARM W/B/JT  14-16 IMPALA LIMITED 

HD

10
2605587 JOBBER 30.00% NAPA CHASSIS NCP 08-26-19 112.40$        (78.68)$       (786.80)$             GS20328 JOBBER 22.00% MEVOTECH 74.00$           (57.72)$               (577.20)$             5CB50433 LIST 41.00%

MASTERPRO MCA 5CD50433 LIST 

PRICE 08/28/19 191.51$              (112.99)$                   (1,129.91)$                 

57 2693429 OR 15254061 NAPA/GM
PREMIUM GRADE OUTER TIE ROD END 13 

TAHOE
10

2693429 JOBBER 30.00% NAPA CHASSIS NCP 08-26-19 34.04$          (23.83)$       (238.28)$             ES800223 JOBBER 25.00% MOOG 33.76$           (25.32)$               (253.20)$             ES800223 LIST 41.00%

MASTERPRO MPC ES800223 LIST 

PRICE 08/28/19 79.64$                (46.99)$                     (469.88)$                    

58 UP8472SD, FT8472 NAPA
F/PADS VARIOUS YEARS  TAHOE S/MET 

SEVERE DUTY POLICE RATED 
100

FT8472 JOBBER 29.00% NAPA CHASSIS NCP 08-26-19 69.11$          (49.07)$       (4,906.81)$           1363.2 LIST 20.00% PERFORMANCE FRICTION 99.22$           (79.38)$               (7,937.60)$          1363.20 LIST 41.00%

PERFORMANCE FRICTION PFC 

1363.20 LIST PRICE 08/28/19 179.64$              (105.99)$                   (10,598.76)$               

59 8472, D1363 VALUE LINE PRODUCT
VARIOUS TAHOE SEMI METALLIC PADS, NON-

POLICE (VALUE LINE)
10

PF8472 JOBBER 34.00% NAPA PFB 08-26-19 30.10$          19.87$        198.70$               17-1363 JOBBER 15.00% POWERSTOP 32.99$           (28.04)$               (280.42)$             MKD1363 LIST 41.00%

BRAKEBEST BB MKD1363 LIST 

PRICE 08/28/19 52.53$                (30.99)$                     (309.93)$                    

60 880721CR NAPA
F ROTORS VARIOUS YEARS  TAHOE ULTRA 

PREMIUM DUTY, POLICE RATED, COATED
50

880721CR JOBBER 29.00% NAPA UNITED U 08-26-19 73.21$          (51.98)$       (2,598.96)$           326.056.01 LIST 20.00% PERFORMANCE FRICTION 184.78$         (147.82)$             (7,391.20)$          580721RGS LIST 41.00%

BRAKEBEST BBR 580721RGS LIST 

PRICE 08/28/19 118.63$              (69.99)$                     (3,499.59)$                 

61 86825 NAPA PREMIUM HD FRT ROTOR 05 TAHOE 2WD 20 86825 JOBBER 29.00% NAPA UNITED UP 08-26-19 37.12$          (26.36)$       (527.10)$             18A925 LIST 46.00% AC-DELCO 109.82$         (59.30)$               (1,186.06)$          56825RGS LIST 41.00% BRAKEBEST SELECT BB 56825RGS 84.73$                (49.99)$                     (999.81)$                    

62
SAME APPLICATION AS 

ABOVE
VALUE LINE PRODUCT FRT ROTOR 05 TAHOE 2WD (value line) 10

4886825 JOBBER 19.00% NAPA NB 08-26-19 31.57$          (25.57)$       (255.72)$             AR8640EVC JOBBER 15.00% POWERSTOP 41.91$           (35.62)$               (356.24)$             **** LIST 41.00%
N/A - NO BID

-$                    -$                         -$                           

63 M3651 NAPA
NEW BRAKE M/CYL 05 TAHOE BRAKE CODE 

JH2
5

M3651 JOBBER 25.00% NAPA NMC 08-26-19 88.51$          (66.38)$       (331.91)$             130.66049 JOBBER 35.00% CENTRIC 140.20$         (91.13)$               (455.65)$             NMC22399 LIST 41.00%

BRAKEBEST SELECT BHH 

NMC22399 LIST PRICE 08/28/19 191.51$              (112.99)$                   (564.95)$                    

64 FT880279KT2 NAPA

EMERGENCY/POLICE SERVICE F/ROTOR KIT 

WITH 2 ROTORS & SEVERE DUTY PADS 13 

TAHOE POLICE.

10
FT880279KT2 JOBBER 29.00% NAPA FLEET FLT 08-26-19 234.77$        (166.69)$     (1,666.87)$           

1363.20 + (2) 

326.056.01 LIST 20.00% PERFORMANCE FRICTION 468.78$         (375.02)$             (3,750.24)$          

1363.2 & 

326.056.01 LIST 41.00%

PERFORMANCE FRICTION PFC 

1363.20 & 326.056.01 LIST PRICE 

08/28/2019 410.41$              (242.14)$                   (2,421.42)$                 

65 42488 WIX PREMIUM AIR FILTER 200 2488 JOBBER 63.00% NAPA FILTERS FIL 08-26-19 21.88$          (8.10)$         (1,619.12)$           PA4113 JOBBER 61.00% BALDWIN 20.15$           (7.86)$                 (1,571.70)$          42488 LIST 41.00% WIX 42488 LIST PRICE 08/28/19 42.36$                (24.99)$                     (4,998.48)$                 

66 33595MP FG1114 WIX
PREMIUM FUEL FILTER MASTER/BULK PACK 

OK
100

3595 JOBBER 63.00% NAPA FILTERS FIL 08-26-19 11.66$          (4.31)$         (431.42)$             BF7668 JOBBER 61.00% BALDWIN 11.01$           (4.29)$                 (429.39)$             33595 LIST 41.00% WIX 33595 LIST PRICE 08/28/19 25.41$                (14.99)$                     (1,499.19)$                 

67 100255 WIX PREMIUM OIL FILTER GM TAHOE 5.3L 1000 100255 JOBBER 63.00% NAPA FILTERS FIL 08-26-19 6.52$            (2.41)$         (2,412.40)$           B7444 JOBBER 61.00% BALDWIN 6.43$            (2.51)$                 (2,507.70)$          WL10255 LIST 41.00% WIX WL10255 LIST PRICE 08/28/19 15.24$                (8.99)$                      (8,991.60)$                 

68 21372 VALUE LINE PRODUCT OIL FILTER FORD APPLICATIONS 200
21372MP JOBBER 21.00% NAPA SFI 08-26-19 1.53$            (1.21)$         (241.74)$             PH820 JOBBER 30.00% PARTS PLUS 2.56$            (1.79)$                 (358.40)$             PTL51372 MP LIST 41.00%

WIX PTL51372MP LIST PRICE 

08/28/19 CASE QTY 52.69$                (31.09)$                     (6,217.42)$                 

69 46883 WIX PREMIUM HD TRUCK AIR FILTER 50 6883 JOBBER 63.00% NAPA FILTERS FIL 08-26-19 82.39$          (30.48)$       (1,524.22)$           PA2705 JOBBER 61.00% BALDWIN 78.71$           (30.70)$               (1,534.85)$          46883 LIST 41.00% WIX 46883 LIST PRICE 08/28/19 194.90$              (114.99)$                   (5,749.55)$                 

70 33674 OR 1R0749 WIX PREMIUM HD DIESEL FUEL FILTER 50 3674MP JOBBER 63.00% NAPA FILTERS FIL 08-26-19 18.01$          (6.66)$         (333.19)$             BF7587 JOBBER 61.00% BALDWIN 18.13$           (7.07)$                 (353.54)$             33674 LIST 41.00% WIX 33674 LIST PRICE 08/28/19 49.14$                (28.99)$                     (1,449.63)$                 

71 57794 WIX PREMIUM HYDRAULIC FILTER 20 7794 JOBBER 63.00% NAPA FILTERS FIL 08-26-19 35.80$          (13.25)$       (264.92)$             BT8899 JOBBER 61.00% BALDWIN 32.50$           (12.68)$               (253.50)$             57794 LIST 41.00% WIX 57794 LIST PRICE 08/28/19 88.12$                (51.99)$                     (1,039.82)$                 

72 46080 WIX
PREMIUM CAB A/C FILTER CAT APPLICATION 

116-7376
20

6080 JOBBER 63.00% NAPA FILTERS FIL 08-26-19 12.50$          (4.63)$         (92.50)$               PA4659 JOBBER 61.00% BALDWIN 14.58$           (5.69)$                 (113.72)$             46080 LIST 41.00% WIX 46080 LIST PRICE 08/28/19 27.10$                (15.99)$                     (319.78)$                    

73 DNV3601, DT-18v 7'6"x18
DONOVAN,CAROLINA,ROLL-

RITE

18FT X7"6" DUMP TRUCK TARP WITH 6" 

POCKET SUITABLE FOR ASPHALT USE
10

DNV3601 JOBBER 18.00% NAPA TRACTION TWD 08-26-19 84.48$          (69.27)$       (692.74)$             1801283 JOBBER 13.00% DONOVAN/SHURCO 14.58$           (12.68)$               (126.85)$             **** LIST 41.00%
SPECIAL ORDER - NO BID 

-$                    -$                         -$                           

74
3525074C91, 1689995C93,  599-

5103
IHC/NAPA

IHC GAUGES INSTRUMENT CLUSTER BOARD 

NEW
5

59951031 JOBBER 11.00% NAPA NHD 08-26-19 353.63$        (314.73)$     (1,573.65)$           599-5103 DORMAN 26.00% DORMAN 338.05$         (250.16)$             (1,250.79)$          599-5103 LIST 41.00%

DORMAN 599-5103 LIST PRICE 

08/28/19 693.20$              (408.99)$                   (2,044.94)$                 

75 4709ES2/077U936N FMSI/TWD

NEW 4709 EXT SERV TRUCK SHOE KIT (23K 

PREMIUM/CERAMIC hd lining) PRICED PER KIT 

OF 2 SHOES AND HARDWARE.

10
077U936N JOBBER 18.00% NAPA TRACTION TWD 08-26-19 85.80$          (70.36)$       (703.56)$             NKEX4709E2 JOBBER 18.00% GPN/ABEX 98.27$           (80.58)$               (805.81)$             PF4709F23 LIST 41.00%

BRAKEBEST HD BBH PF4709F23 

LIST PRICE 08/28/19 27.10$                (15.99)$                     (159.89)$                    

76 28408E ACCURIDE HD 22.5X8 WHEEL (WHITE) 20
HDW-28408E JOBBER 18.00% NAPA TRACTION 08-26-19 88.39$          (72.48)$       (1,449.60)$           

51408PKW 

HT21 LIST 29.00% ACCURIDE 150.00$         (106.50)$             (2,130.00)$          **** LIST 41.00%
SPECIAL ORDER - NO BID 

-$                    -$                         -$                           

77 X60794/3600A GUNITE 16.5 X 7 TRUCK DRUM 10 X60794 JOBBER 18.00% NAPA TRACTION TWD 08-26-19 122.63$        (100.56)$     (1,005.57)$           668864F20 JOBBER 30.00% WEBB 178.58$         (125.01)$             (1,250.06)$          54261-018 LIST 41.00% KIC 54261-018 LIST PRICE 08/28/19 454.22$              (267.99)$                   (2,679.90)$                 

78 3339006 OR L56-0001 VARIOUS
TRUCK HOOD LATCH KENWORTH AND 

VARIOUS APP.
10

3339006 JOBBER 11.00% NAPA NHD 08-26-19 27.26$          (24.26)$       (242.61)$             315-5401 JOBBER 26.00% DORMAN 32.71$           (24.21)$               (242.05)$             315-5401 LIST 41.00%

DORMAN DOR 315-5401 LIST 

PRICE 08/28/19 52.53$                (30.99)$                     (309.93)$                    

79 24X30 FLAPS OR 823-5075 NAPA
UNIVERSAL 24X30 1/4 THICK MIN. TRUCK 

MUDFLAPS NO LOGO
20

823-5075 JOBBER 18.00% NAPA TRACTION TWD 08-26-19 11.20$          (9.18)$         (183.68)$             24X30AV JOBBER 5.00% RUB 8.50$            (8.08)$                 (161.50)$             24-30 LIST 41.00%

GLOBETECH MUD 24-30 LIST 

PRICE 08/28/19 27.10$                (15.99)$                     (319.78)$                    

3+

BRAKE PRODUCTS

FILTERS: SEE NOTE IN BIDDING REQUIREMENTS! ALL FILTERS MUST BE SAME BRAND!

VARIOUS TRUCK PARTS

SUSPENSION, DRIVETRAIN AND STEERING
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O'REILLY AUTOMOTIVE STORES, INC. D/B/A O'REILLY AUTO PARTSTPH/THE PARTS HOUSE GENUINE PARTS CO/ NAPA

PART#

80 6654773 NAPA
LEFT FRONT WINDOW REGULATOR WITH 

MOTOR  2010  C/VIC
10

6654773 JOBBER 28.00% NAPA NOE DORMAN 08-26-19 78.06$          (56.20)$       (562.03)$             741-664 JOBBER 26.00% DORMAN 77.31$           (57.21)$               (572.09)$             741-664 LIST 41.00%

DORMAN DOR 741-664 LIST PRICE 

08/28/19 122.02$              (71.99)$                     (719.92)$                    

81 598 PERMATEX ULTRA BLACK SILICONE 3.3 OZ TUBE 765-1589 50
765-1589 JOBBER 24.00% NAPA BK BALKAMP 08-26-19 7.41$            (5.63)$         (281.58)$             82180 JOBBER 23.00% PERMATEX 4.68$            (3.60)$                 (180.18)$             82180 LIST 41.00%

PERMATEX PER 82180 LIST PRICE 

08/28/19 14.39$                (8.49)$                      (424.51)$                    

82 ATC20 BUSS BOX OF 5 FUSES PRICED PER BOX/CARD 20
7821110 JOBBER 24.00% NAPA BK BALKAMP 08-26-19 2.15$            (1.63)$         (32.68)$               ATC20 JOBBER 12.00% BUSS 4.45$            (3.92)$                 (78.32)$               ATO20 LIST 41.00%

LITTEFUSE LIT ATO20BP LIST 

PRICE 08/28/19 6.76$                  (3.99)$                      (79.77)$                      

83 4800, 095050 MAC,CRC
BRAKE CLEAN NON CLORINATED PRICED PER 

CAN
240

4800 JOBBER 29.00% NAPA MACS MAC 08-26-19 3.37$            (2.39)$         (574.25)$             9641 JOBBER 10.00% CRC/PARTS PLUS 2.09$            (1.88)$                 (451.44)$             46580 LIST 41.00%

O'REILLY CHEMICAL ORC 46580 

LIST PRICE 08/28/2019 5.07$                  (2.99)$                      (717.91)$                    

84 25240, NPB-24 TRICO
24"  BEAM STYLE UNIV WIPER BLADES HEAVY 

DUTY
50

NPB24 JOBBER 22.00% NAPA OWI 08-26-19 10.23$          (7.98)$         (398.97)$             C24OE JOBBER 39.00% ANCO 11.33$           (6.91)$                 (345.57)$             25-240 LIST 41.00%

TRICO TRI 25-240 LIST PRICE 

08/28/19 47.44$                (27.99)$                     (1,399.48)$                 

85 31-22, NP-22 ANCO, NAPA 22"  WIPER BLADES VARIOUS APPLICATIONS 100
NP22 JOBBER 22.00% NAPA OWI 08-26-19 3.80$            (2.96)$         (296.40)$             31-22 JOBBER 39.00% ANCO 4.60$            (2.81)$                 (280.60)$             3397001367 LIST 41.00%

BOSCH BOS 3397001367 LIST PRICE 

08/28/19 144.05$              (84.99)$                     (8,498.95)$                 

86 10817 STANT GAS CAP VAR APPLICATIONS 703-1231 200
1513834 JOBBER 15.00% NAPA ATM 08-26-19 6.14$            (5.22)$         (1,043.80)$           MGC817 JOBBER 12.00% MOTORAD 4.12$            (3.63)$                 (725.12)$             10817 LIST 41.00%

STANT STA 10817 LIST PRICE 

08/28/19 18.63$                (10.99)$                     (2,198.34)$                 

87 394989 BRIGGS STRATTON SMALL ENGINE CARB KIT 7-02059 10
7-02059 JOBBER 21.00% NAPA SME 08-26-19 28.47$          (22.49)$       (224.91)$             394989 LIST 20.00% BRIGGS & STRATTON 47.50$           (38.00)$               (380.00)$             7-02059 LIST 41.00%

PRIME LINE PRI 7-02059 LIST 

PRICE 08/28/19 49.14$                (28.99)$                     (289.93)$                    

88 TG7000W NAPA UNIVERSAL HD TOGGLE SWITCH 5
TG7000W JOBBER 33.00% NAPA ECH ECHLIN 08-26-19 8.13$            (5.45)$         (27.24)$               DS167 JOBBER 11.00% STANDARD 7.27$            (6.47)$                 (32.35)$               DS167 LIST 41.00%

STANDARD STD DS167 LIST PRICE 

8/28/19 17.44$                (10.29)$                     (51.45)$                      

89 360-233,N484 ANSELL,NAPA
XL NITRILE GLOVES TEXTURED FINGERS 

100/BOX  ORANGE OR BLACK
10

360-233 JOBBER 5.00% NAPA NSE 08-26-19 13.53$          (12.85)$       (128.54)$             BKNF105 JOBBER 34.00% SEMPERMED 10.12$           (6.68)$                 (66.79)$               66574 LIST 41.00% SAS 66574 LIST PRICE 08/28/19 37.27$                (21.99)$                     (219.89)$                    

90 UPCHARGE MISC
% UPCHARGE FOR PARTS PURCHASED FROM 

OUTSIDE VENDORS, USE $100 AS BASE AMT.
50

PU

COST 

PLUS 1900.00% NAPA PU 100.00$        119.00$      5,950.00$            

UPCHARGE MISC

2500.00%

% UPCHARGE FOR PARTS 

PURCHASED FROM OUTSIDE 

VENDORS, USE $100 AS BASE 

AMT. 100.00$         125.00$              6,250.00$           OSP 

LIST

2500.00%

% UPCHARGE FOR PARTS 

PURCHASED FROM OUTSIDE 

VENDORS, USE $100 AS BASE 

AMT. 100.00$              125.00$                    6,250.00$                  

11,399.07$    (8,529.21)$   (71,220.16)$    13,494.34$    (9,485.58)$            (84,077.01)$   19,053.22$           (11,057.40)$                (128,486.25)$       

MISCELLANOUS PARTS

GRAND TOTAL: 

EEOC Form

Non-Collusion Affidavit

Affidavit of Contractor

Signature Page

Price Sheet 

PACA Required Forms

Experience Statement

Debarment Statement

GENUINE PARTS/NAPA

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

Notification of Intent to Respond 

REQUIRED DOCUMENTS

701 39TH STREET NORTH Birmingham, AL  35222  | JASON BENEKE P: 1-877-558-9287; F: 205-592-0800 E: JASON_BENEKE@GENPT.COM 

O'REILLY AUTOMOTIVE STORES, INC D/B/A O'REILLY AUTO PARTS

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

TPH/THE PARTS HOUSE 

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

O'REILLY AUTOMOTIVE STORES, INC D/B/A O'REILLY AUTO PARTS

41% OR BETTER

41% OR BETTER

41% OR BETTER

**NOTE: CALCULATIONS BASED ON DISCOUNT SUBMITTED/WRITTEN PER LINE ITEM**

O' REILLY AUTOMOTIVE STORES INC.   233 S. PATTERSON Springfield, MO 65802  | ROANEN BARRON P: 1-417-829-5879 7;F: 800-925-0899 E: PROBIDS@OREILLYAUTO.COM

GENUINE PARTS/NAPA

For prices of all items of vehicle parts which are NOT INCLUDED in the core list vendor will allow ___% discount from the 5%

PRICING/MAXIMUM DISCOUNT

Guaranteed maximum discount available if contract is renewed for 2nd year ___________________

Guaranteed maximum discount available if contract is renewed for 3rd year ___________________

5%

5%

TPH/THE PARTS HOUSE 

5%

5%

5%

YES

TPH/THE PARTS HOUSE 2625 4TH AVENUE SOUTH Birmingham, AL  35223  | RICHARD KILPATRICK P: 1-800-883-7097;F: 727-573-8935 E: RKILPATRICK@THEPARTSHOUSE.COM

CONTACT INFORMATION

GENUINE PARTS/NAPA 


